
Year 4 camp  

Year 4 camp was the best 3 days of my 
life!!!!!!!!!!!!!!! 

 

So I guess we can start in the bus trip. It was 2 hours with a lot 

of kids and the best teachers, Miss Tilley and Mrs Diggins. 

While we drove to camp we watched a movie, Charlie and The 

Chocolate Factory.  

 

At camp we got to do nine activities. They were Flying Fox, 
Water Slide, Low Ropes Course, Photo Hunt, Disc Golf, 
Canoeing, Camp Cooking, Hut Building, and Achery. They were 
all so fun and it was the best fun I have ever been on. 
  
My cabins mates were Max, Finn, James C and Tenzin. It was 
really fun and we did not get much sleep at all on the first night 
but on the second night we got some more sleep because we 
were so tired from all the fun activities.  
  
The food at camp was amazing! I had duty group on the first 
day and we had the best food there. It filled me up for the 
whole day and it felt like we did not stop eating. 
 
The Disco was so fun on night one. Everyone dance and we 
finished with a dance competition. Connor and Aaliyah were 
awarded the dance champs for 2019. It was such a fun party. 



On the second night we had a movie night with popcorn. We 
watched a movie called Like Mike. Everyone was quiet and it 
was like being in the cinemas but with our PJ’s on and laying 
in our sleeping bags. It was so cosy!  
 
The highlights of camp was the definitely food and the 
activities. It was seriously the best three days of my life. It was 
so fun and awesome and I would very much go again and it 
was the best. 
 
The best thing about camp was the teachers they were so 
awesome and they made it so fun. I just had an amazing time 
with them. The best teacher was probably Miss Tilley. She 
made it the best camp ever. Her singing is the best I have ever 
heard which I have not heard in a while from such an amazing 
person and I want her to come all of the camps and all the 
other teachers made it an amazing camp too. 
 

 
 

James Bowles 4D 


