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Football Results  

 
 

Team Villa Padua Iona SPLC SPC SLC ATC 

6A 
Player of the 

Match 
3 – 1 

Oliver Imlay 

5 – 2 
Nicolas 

Cienfuegos 
Rafael Marufu 

4 – 3 
Josh Pola 

10 – 0 
Rafa Marufu 
Toby Russell 

0 – 1 
Nico 

Cienfuegos 

1 – 3 
Paddy Garton  

6B 
Player of the 

Match 
0 – 1 

Conal Heenan 
7 – 1 

Cooper 
Donaghy 

7 – 0 
Dillan Keane 

13 – 1 
Adhu 

Sudheesh 
Cooper 

Donaghy 

6 – 1 
Fynn Hall 

Conal Heenan 

3 – 1 
Tyler Bains 

Isaac Walter 
 

6C 
Player of the 

Match 

11 – 0 
Cooper 

Chaseling 
Otto van Boxel 

4 – 3 
Percy Hede 

3 – 2 
Matthew 
Davies 

vs. Padua 6D 
4 – 0 

Liam Adams 

4 – 1 
Charlie Brown 
James Phelan 

4 – 0 
Gian Air  

6 Gold 
Player of the 

Match 

12 – 0 
Mania Fitialo 
Ben Arcus-
Simpson 

1 – 6 
Oscar 

Chapman 
Julian Bishop 

4 – 0 
Tom Di Sipio 

vs. Padua 6F 
1 – 3 

Mania Fitialo 
Julian Bishop 

2 – 3 
Tom Di Sipio 
Cooper Lewis 

3 – 1 
Ben Arcus-
Simpson 
Charlie 
Spokes 

 

6 White 
Player of the 

Match 

vs. Padua 6F 
10 – 2 

Jack Hodges 

vs. Iona 6D 
9 – 2 

Patrick Naude 

vs. Padua 6E 
6 – 2 

Cormac 
McKenna 

vs. Villa 6D 
14 – 0 

Seb Candiotto 

vs. SLC 6 White 
5 – 2 

Jackson Lacy 

vs. SPC 6D 
1 – 2 

Cormac 
McKenna 

 

        

5A 
Player of the 

Match 

1 – 1 
Knight Chan-

Riotto 

2 – 4 
Dominic 
Guinea 

5 – 5 
Patrick 

Hambleton 

10 – 1 
Mitch Belyea 
Aidan Field 

2 – 0 
Luca 

Pozzebon 
4 – 4 

Rhys Adams  

5B 
Player of the 

Match 
4 – 6 

Seb Fallon 
3 – 3 

Danny Carey 
1 – 1 

Etien Raad 
13 – 0 

Etien Raad 
3 – 2 

Ben Norlander 
1 – 3 

Etien Raad  

5C 
Player of the 

Match 
9 – 1 

Max King 
1 – 1 

Eli Nipperess 
3 – 0 

Harrison 
Heisel 

8 – 0 
Andre Bennett 

10 – 0 
Gun Cooter 

2 – 2 
Oliver Scott  

5 Gold 
Player of the 

Match 

3 – 2 
Luca 

Pozzebon 
0 – 10 

0 – 10 
Ben 

Mulholland 
Mac Walker 

1 – 2 
Connor Brown 

Riley Freer 

0 – 11 
Josh Bany 

Mac Walker 

1 – 13 
Barney 

Armstrong 
 

5 White 
Player of the 

Match 

vs. Padua 5F 
7 – 1 

Michael 
Sorbello 

1 – 1 
Toby 

Watherston 

2 – 0  
James 

Channells 

vs. SLC 5F 
5 – 0  
Toby 

Watherson 

vs. Padua 5F 
1 – 2 

Nate Pugh 
0 – 2 

Frank Warokra  
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Around the Grounds  

 
 
6A 
The 6As faced Laurie's in the penultimate game of the season. After SLC beat Marist convincingly in the 
trial, this was an opportunity to see the improvement this team has made. SLC scored early and from 
then the game remained quite even before a second goal just before half time stopped any momentum 
Marist had. 2-0 down at half time the Marist boys had some chances in the second half but just couldn't 
convert. A third goal sealed the result before Rafael Marufu scored a consolation for Marist. 
The boys stayed in the game all the way to the end putting pressure on the SLC goal but were just 
outclassed on the day. 
 
6B 
6Bs added to their winning streak on the weekend against St Laurence’s College. After a loss to SLC in 
their trial game, the boys went in nervous, but determined to come away with a win, and it didn’t take 
long for Abe Patricks to put us on the scoreboard. Our early goal set the mood for the game and the 
boys dug in, focused on adding to their goal count. A tough and physical opposition, the boys didn’t back 
down, determined to gain possession, and as a result, majority of the game was played in our half. Isaac 
Walter, who had already played a half with the 6As, was unstoppable in both attack and defense, and is 
to be commended for his efforts in this game. Dillan Keane – our centre back – did well in chasing down 
the ball and bringing it back into our half. A beautiful strike on the ball from Tyler Baines saw us take out 
total goal count to 3. The boys all play their positions well and each member of the team can rely on 
each other which I think makes this such a great team. I look forward to our final game this weekend and 
I hope the boys continue to add to their winning streak. 
 
6C 
On a cold, early start to Saturday morning, the 6C team were looking to maintain their undefeated streak 
against another undefeated team – St Laurence’s College. Playing on Astro turf for the first time this 
season, the boys took a bit of time getting used to the surface. After about 10-minutes, Marist scored 
their first goal through Gian Air, which enabled the boys to play more freely now that they had the lead. 
They then doubled their lead through an indirect free kick, where Matthew Davies expertly placed the 
ball into the back of the net. Up 2-0 at halftime, the message to the boys was to maintain the momentum 
and continue taking our opportunities when they come in front of the goal. This message was put into 
action as Preston Ryder followed-up on a fumble from the goalkeeper to extend the lead to 3-0. Towards 
the end of the match, Matthew Davies decided to take a shot from a long way out from goal, where 
Percy Hede was quick to collect the goalkeeper deflection and push the lead out to 4-0. Another great 
game for the 6C team and they will be hoping to continue their unbeaten run in their final match this 
coming weekend. Man of the match, for his display at both ends of the field (in attack and defence) goes 
to Gian Air. 
 
6 Gold 
A good all around game by the 6 Gold lads this week leading to a 3-1 win over a spirited Laurie's team. 
Charlie Spokes worked hard in goal in the first half and displayed some great field vision in the second 
half whilst playing up front, with excellent passes to his teammates. Ben Arcus-Simpson was strong in 
defence, his chase downs making life tough for the opposition strikers. And Cooper Lewis has found his 
home in the right back position with an outstanding game where his great tackling sent lots of ball down 
to our strikers. We only have one game left gentleman, let’s make it a good one! 
 
6 White 
Facing a hard game against St Pats 6Ds with only 8 men and no subs, 6 White had a tough match. 
Displaying brilliant defence and attack throughout the larger pitch we were 1-0 up. Unfortunately, in the 
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last few minutes, it was just too much for the boys ending the game on a 2-1 loss. Player of the match: 
Cormac McKenna. 
 

 
5A 
A very competitive game with both teams scoring numerous goals after each other. Regardless of our 
boys starting a man down for the first 5 minutes they managed to stop a full-strength Laurie’s team from 
scoring whilst creating their own chances. A credit to Laurie’s who are a skilled and polished team, 
however the boys didn’t give them the chance to control the game as we were first to every ball and 
tackle. Laurie’s scored to put them up with a minute to go, their senior supporters and bench ran onto the 
field. We are 4-3 down. However, it only made our boys want it more. Finally, after many corners a ball 
was passed across goal going out, but just before the line Mitch Belyea came sliding in to score drawing 
us the game. A great result and team performance showing how far these boys have come to go from an 
8-1 loss in trials to a 4-4 draw. 
 
5B 
Although the 5Bs lost 3-1, the boys played extremely well and showed their perseverance. The St 
Laurence’s boys brought some strong competition, which was hard to beat. Nevertheless, I’m still super 
proud of the team for showing up and persisting throughout the game. Our loss will give us more 
determination to win next weekend. 
 
5C 
In an exciting match against Laurie’s, Marist 5Cs battled to a thrilling 2-2 draw. The game was filled with 
intense moments and impressive displays of skill from both teams. 
 
Laurie’s took an early lead, scoring in the first half, but Marist 5Cs quickly responded. Max showcased 
his goal-scoring abilities, finding the back of the net in the 14th minute, levelling the score. The second 
half brought renewed energy, and Gun delivered a fantastic goal for Marist 5Cs just 12 minutes in, giving 
the team the lead. However, Laurie’s fought back determinedly, equalizing the score just before full-time, 
resulting in a hard-fought 2-2 draw. 
 
The match demonstrated the competitiveness and resilience of both teams. Marist 5Cs exhibited great 
teamwork with Man of the Match going to Oliver Scott for his strong defensive effort throughout the 
game. 
 
5 Gold 
5 Gold’s enthusiasm on the field was much improved in last Saturday’s match against St Laurence’s 
despite the 13-1 loss. The boys continued to fight hard against a relentless opposition. Congratulations 
to our only goal scorer, Barney Armstrong, whose agility in attack has improved each week. Special 
congratulations are extended to all the boys in the team who have remained gracious in consistent 
defeats. Their sportsmanship on and off the field has been a credit to Marist and has been something 
that has not gone unnoticed. In preparation for our last game, the boys will be working hard at clearing 
the ball and strategic positioning on the field.  
 
5 White 
What a tough game last Saturday! Despite their amazing effort, 5 White lost 2-0 in what turned out to be 
a very close game. Franky Warokra was player of the match, showing excellent skills in a range of 
positions on the field. Michael Sorbello provided amazing defense with solid support from all team 
members, particularly Xavier Ross and James Channells. Well done boys on such a positive attitude 
towards the game.  
 


