
father’s  
day 

breakfast

All students are invited to bring along the 
significant men in their lives to celebrate 
Father’s Day and share breakfast with the 
Mount Carmel community.

The special people in our lives will be treated 
to a hot breakfast from Big Henry’s Food 
Truck, while students will enjoy a breakfast 
buffet to kick-start their day.

Founder of Tasmanian based organisation, 
SPEAK UP! Stay ChatTY, Mitch McPherson 
will be our guest speaker at the breakfast.  
Mitch is a family man, a new father and a 
husband. He’s an ardent Carlton supporter, 
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lover of sport and avid coffee drinker. He is 
passionate about sparking conversations 
and encouraging others to speak up. Mitch 
will host a Q&A session covering topics such 
as how he started his charity, the importance 
of wellbeing & kindness, supporting one 
another, checking in with family and friends 
and asking for help.

How to purchase your tickets: 
Tickets are $10 per adult and $5 per student.
Book via the Qkr app. Tickets are limited and 
available now 9am on Tuesday 31 August 
2021, unless sold out prior.

 


