
VCAL Intermediate - READING FOR SELF-EXPRESSION - Compare Two (2) texts from different 
cultures.   

STUDENT NAME:Manaia 

Date: 14/05/2021 

Instructions:  Students are to read the Dreamtime story and then the Greek mythology 
story.  Answer the questions at the end in full and submit as a learning task completed.     

1 Dreamtime Story - The Rainbow Serpent 

This legend is the quintessential Dreaming story, and easily the most widely known around 
Australia.  ong ago in the Dreamtime when the earth lay sleeping and nothing moved or grew, lived 
the Rainbow Serpent. Then one day the Rainbow Serpent awoke and come out from beneath the 
earth. Refreshed from her long slumber she travelled far and wide leaving winding tracks from her 
huge body and then returning to the place she had first appeared. 

On her return she called to the frogs "come out!" The frogs came out slowly as their bellies were full 
with water which they had stored during their long sleep. The Rainbow Serpent tickled their 
stomachs and when the frogs laughed, the water spilled out all over the earth to fill the tracks of the 
Rainbow Serpent. This is how the lakes and the rivers were first formed. 

With water, grass and trees began to grow which woke all the animals who then followed the 
Rainbow Serpent across the land. They were happy on earth and each lived and gathered food with 
their own tribe. Some animals lived in rocks, some on the vast plains, and others in trees and in the 
sky. The Rainbow Serpent made laws that they were all to obey but some began to make trouble 
and argue. The Rainbow Serpent said "Those who keep my laws will be rewarded; I will give them 
human form. Those who break my laws will be punished and turned to stone & will never to walk 
the earth again". Those who broke the law became stone and were turned into mountains and hills 
and those who were obedient were turned into human form and were each given their own totem 
of the animal, bird or reptile from when they began. The tribes knew themselves by their totems - 
kangaroo, emu, carpet snake, and many, many more. So no one would starve, the Rainbow Serpent 
ruled that no man should eat of his totem, but only of other totems. This way there was food for 
everyone. 

The tribes lived together on the land given to them by the Rainbow Serpent or Mother of Life and 
knew the land would always be theirs, and no one should ever take it from them. The Rainbow 
Serpent dreaming in Aboriginal society represents one of the great and powerful forces of nature 
and spirit. Connected to water, the Rainbow Serpent is the great life giver, and protector of water, 
which is his spiritual home. 

The culture of Australia's Aboriginal people is one of the oldest in the world – Aboriginal Australian 
Culture dates back more than 60,000 years! There are many archaeological sites throughout the 
country where the long history of Indigenous people can be found.  How did the Dreamtime word 
originate? The Dreamtime came into being as a word to describe the Aboriginal Creation mythology, 
and was first used in the 1890s. It was developed from Aranda culture by a white man who was 
based in Alice Springs and had a very good working knowledge of the local Aboriginal languages. 

2 Greek Mythology story (800 BC) 

Troy 

 
Each of the great cities of Greece sent an army to join the war against the Trojans – each, that is, 
except for one: The city of Thebes refused to join the war, saying that it had no quarrel with the far 



away Trojans, and so the Greek King Agamemnon (Aga-mem-non) decided to teach the Thebans a 
lesson. He ordered his men to destroy their beautiful city and take its treasure – and that is what 
they did. While the ruined city of Thebes was still burning, the greatest of the Greek warriors shared 
out the prizes of war. 

King Agamemnon chose for himself one of the captives - a beautiful young girl called Chryseis (Cry-
see-is), a priest’s daughter. Agamemnon told her that she must live with him from now on, and be 
his slave. The girl wept bitterly and begged to be returned to her father, but King Agamemnon had a 
cruel heart and was unmoved by her tears. 

Eventually, the Greek ships reached Troy, and the army set up a vast camp on the beach not far from 
the city. One evening, the good old priest, who was the father of Chryseis, arrived at the camp and 
asked to meet King Agamemnon and all the greatest of the Greeks. 

He said, “Oh Agamemnon, leader of men, may the gods grant your wish to destroy the magnificent 
city of Troy, and may all the Greeks return home safely in their black ships, but grant me this favour; 
free my daughter and accept in her place a gift of great treasure that I have brought for you.” 

The Greek army cheered the old man for his generous offer, and for the love that he had shown for 
his daughter, but Agamemnon flew into a rage. “Old man,” said he, “let me not find you hanging 
about our ships, nor coming here again. I will not free your lovely daughter. She shall grow old in my 
house, in Argos, far from her home. So get out of my sight right now, or it will be the worse for you!” 

The priest was afraid and swiftly left, but later that evening he knelt down on the shore of the 
resounding sea and prayed to the immortal god, Apollo of the silver bow. Apollo heard the good old 
man’s prayer for just revenge, and he took up his silver bow and fired arrows into the Greek camp. 
The arrows of Apollo brought disease, and many of the Greek soldiers fell ill. 

By far the greatest of the Greek warriors was Achilles (A-kill-ees). He was faster and stronger than 
any man alive, and also very proud. 

When Achilles saw the Greek soldiers dying of disease, he called a meeting of all the generals and 
spoke as follows, “Noble Agamemnon, though you are our leader, I must speak the truth. It was 
wrong to threaten the priest, a good old man who came to you with a generous offer. The gods are 
angry with us for what you did, and matters must be put right. You must return the lovely Chryseis 
to her father.” 

King Agamemnon, was surprised to hear such words, as he was not at all used to being told what to 
do. “Great Achilles,” he said, “Brave and strong you may be, but I am king and I shall do what I like 
and you shall know your place!” 

To which Achilles replied, “You are too greedy! Why should all the Greeks suffer for your evil ways. I, 
for one, am not going to follow a leader like you into battle.” 

Now King Agamemnon was absolutely furious but he also understood that something must be done 
to appease the gods and stop the plague that was destroying his army, and so the next day he 
ordered a boat to take the young girl back to her father, but he also sent messengers to the tent of 
Achilles and ordered him hand over his own slave girl. From that moment on the pride of Achilles 
was so hurt that he refused to take part in the battle for Troy, but instead stayed inside his tent and 
sulked while the Greeks went out and fought. 

Soon after, the Trojans opened the great doors of their city and their army marched out - like a flock 
of wild birds swooping back and forth and calling with screeching voices. 



Now the finest warrior among the Trojans was Prince Hector. He was the brother of Paris, but he 
was quite different in character. Hector was brave and noble, while Paris loved fine clothes and 
parties and enjoyed his riches to the full. 

As they rode out to battle, Hector said to his brother, “Paris, it is for your sake that thousands of 
brave soldiers will die today. It is only because you ran away with the Greek Queen Helen that this 
great army has arrived at our gates with the aim of destroying our beautiful city, killing all the men, 
and carrying off the women and children as slaves. It would be better had you not been born, my 
brother.” 

When he heard this, Paris felt ashamed, and to make amends he drove his chariot out in front the 
Trojan army and towards the enemy. In his fiercest voice, Paris called out to the Greeks to send forth 
their bravest warrior, and to fight him in single combat to decide the war – so that others need not 
suffer. 

On the Greek side, King Menelaus (Menel-a-us) hated Paris more than any other man alive, so 
Menelaus jumped out of his chariot and said, “I will gladly fight Paris, and kill him with my spear 
which is made of ash wood and tipped with cruel bronze.” 

When Paris heard this, he was so frightened that he coiled back like a man who has seen a snake, 
and he shrank into the protection of his men. Great laughter arose from the Greek army, and the 
Trojans were furious with Prince Paris for bringing shame on them. Then Paris began to worry that if 
the beautiful Helen heard about his running away, she would not love him anymore. So he gathered 
his courage, and went out once more in front of the army, and again shouted out to the Greeks, “I 
call on you men to lay your swords and spears on the ground while King Menelaus and I fight one 
another – hero against hero.” 

Menelaus did not give Paris time to change his mind. He hurled his spear at him so that it broke his 
shield, but just missed his body. Paris fell backwards, and soon Menelaus was on him, dragging him 
by the plume of his helmet towards the Greek army. However, the Goddess of Love, Aphrodite, who 
was fond of Paris, saw what was happening and came to his aid disguised as a cloud. She scooped 
him into her lovely arms, and whisked him back to his Palace where the fair and fragrant Helen was 
waiting for him. So the Greeks and the Trojans fought each other in battle. 

Many brave soldiers were killed and wounded on both sides, but as long as Achilles refused to help 
the Greeks, the Trojans were stronger and drove the Greeks back to their camp. At night, a thousand 
camp fires glowed upon the plain, and by the light of each fire there sat fifty men while the horses 
chomped oats and corn beside their chariots and waited for dawn to come. 

The Greeks begged the great warrior Achilles to come out and fight, but still he refused to join the 
battle. His best friend, Patroclus, came up with a cunning plan. He secretly put on the magnificent 
armour of Achilles and went out into the battle, looking exactly like the great hero. He knew that 
when the Greeks saw him, they would gain courage at the sight of Achilles and fight with redoubled 
strength, and when the Trojans saw him, they would think that the warrior they most feared had 
returned, and would lose heart. When the Trojans saw Patroclus dressed like Achilles, Prince Hector 
flew at him with his spear and killed him. Only then did he discover that it was not Achilles whom he 
had killed, but Patroclus. 

When the mighty Achilles heard that his best friend had been killed by Hector, his anger and sorrow 
were great in equal measure, and he stood up before a meeting of the Greek army and said, “As you 
know, King Agamemnon has insulted me and I have every right not to fight in this stupid war; but 
now things have changed. My best friend has been killed by Prince Hector of Troy. It is for the sake 
of Patroclus, who was dearer to me than any other man, that I will take up the fight and avenge his 
death.” 



When the Greek army heard this, they all cheered and threw their helmets in the air, for they knew 
that with Achilles on their side, victory could be theirs.  When Prince Hector saw that Achilles stood 
once again at the head of the Greek army, he knew that there was only one thing for it. He must go 
out and fight Achilles, and decide the fate of Troy. 

As Prince Hector was leaving for battle, he went in search of his wife, the lovely Andromache (An-
drom-a-kee). He found her walking along the great walls of the city, holding their little baby in her 
arms. When she saw her husband, Andromache said, “Brave Hector, I beg you; do not go out today 
to fight Achilles. What will I do when you are gone? Think of your little son. What use is a father to 
him if he is dead?”  Hector replied that he could not refuse to fight, as the Greeks and the Trojans 
would say he was a coward.  He stretched his arms towards his child, but when boy saw the 
horsehair plume that nodded fiercely from his father’s helmet, he was scared and cried, nursing his 
head into his mother’s bosom. 

His father and mother laughed to see him, and Hector took the helmet from his head and laid it all 
gleaming upon the ground. Then he took his darling child, kissed him, and dangled him in his arms, 
praying over him to Zeus, the king of all the gods. “Mighty Zeus,” he said, "May one day people say 
that this child is even braver than his father, and a mightier warrior in battle, so that their praise 
gladdens the heart of his mother."  Hector rode out before the gates of Troy. Achilles, seeing him, 
started to run with all his might towards Hector, ready to hurl his spear at his hated enemy. Hector 
jumped from his chariot and stood firm, waiting to meet Achilles, but secretly he thought to himself, 
“What if I were to lay down my shield and helmet, lean my spear against the wall and go straight up 
to noble Achilles? What if I were to promise to hand back Helen, who was the cause of all this war, 
and to let the Greeks take half of all the treasure in the city? Why argue with myself in this way? 
Were I to go up to him now, he would show me no mercy.” 

As he pondered, the swift-footed Achilles charged up to him as if he were Aries himself, the plumed 
God of battle. The bronze tip of Achilles' spear gleamed around him like the rays of the rising sun. 
Fear came over Hector and he turned and ran, while Achilles darted after him with his utmost speed. 
As a mountain hawk, the swiftest of birds, swoops down upon some trembling white dove - that is 
how Achilles made straight for Hector with all his might, while Hector fled around the city walls as 
fast as his legs could carry him. 

Achilles chased Hector three times around the walls of Troy until at last Hector turned and fought. 
First Achilles threw his spear at Hector and missed. Hector then threw his spear at Achilles and hit 
his shield, but did not break it. They fell on each with clashing bronze swords, and Achilles, for he 
was the stronger hero, killed Hector. 

 
When they heard the sad news, all the women of Troy wept for the loss of their greatest hero, but 
none wept more than his wife, Andromache.  Now that the finest hero of the Trojans was dead, the 
Greek army thought that they would soon win the war. King Priam of Troy greatly grieved the loss of 
his bravest son, and feared that the city would soon be defeated, but this is not how things turned 
out - well, not yet - for Apollo, the winged god of the silver bow, again decided to help the Trojans. 
One day, in the midst of battle, he came up to Prince Paris and said to him, “Hail Paris, Prince of 
Troy. Lift up your bow and fire an arrow into the Greek army. I will guide its point into Achilles and 
kill him.” 

When he heard this, Prince Paris replied, “Almighty Apollo, I will gladly do as you ask, but will I not 
just waste my arrow? Everyone knows that when Achilles was a baby, his mother dipped him in the 
River Styx that runs through the Underworld – and as a result, no weapon can wound him, for the 
waters of the River Styx make a man immortal.”  Apollo replied, “Paris, you speak the truth, but the 
gods gave the great Achilles a choice – he could lead a short and glorious life, or a long and boring 
one. He chose glory and so his life must be short.”  So Paris dipped his arrow in deadly poison and 



fired it into the air. It flew in an ark and its poisoned tip drove into Achilles’ heel - for when Achilles’ 
mother had dipped him in the river of the underworld, she had held him by his heel, and no water 
had touched it. Now Achilles fell from his chariot, and soon his great body lay on the ground, dead. 

And that is the story of how the Greeks and the Trojans fought for nine years without either side 
gaining victory. Many brave warriors died on either side, and many tears were shed over lost sons 
and lost friends. Soon I will tell you how the war ended with a cunning trick. And Bertie is reminding 
me not to forget to tell you about the Wooden Horse. 

 
Q1:  What did you like / not like about the Dreamtime story? Why? What is the story about? Give a 
short summary of the story in your own words.   What is the message of the story? 

I liked the story because it’s a rough idea of how earth came to be, it’s about a rainbow serpent who 
lets the earth grow and thrive with animals who live in harmony and turn into humans when they 
live by the serpent’s rules. 

 
Q2: What did you like / not like about the Greek mythology (Troy)? Why? What is the story about? 
Give a short summary of the story in your own words. What is the message of the story? 

I did not like the story because there are too many scenes where a god helps out the people, the 
story is about the invasion of the Trojan city by the Greeks and all the setbacks they suffer. 

 
Q3:  Are stories like the Rainbow Serpent unique for Aboriginal culture, or can similarities be found 
in Greek mythology, in other countries and cultures?  Please explain.    

The rainbow serpent is unique to aboriginal culture but there is god like entities in Greek mythology 

 
Q4:  How do the stories relate to the natural world? What elements of nature are included in the 
stories? 

The rainbow serpent story depicts the creation of life and nature while the troy story depicts the 
exploitation of nature in war (i.e. the river of Styx) 

 
Q5: What can you learn from the story about human relations (for example, does the story show 
how different people relate to each other or how people should behave)? 

I learned that people will perform any stunt to either cheer up or avenge a mate of theirs 

 
Q6:  Do folk stories still play an important role in western culture? Why/why not? 

They do because they have morals that would benefit the 21st century and they depict history that 
people can learn from the mistakes that were in the story. 

 
Q7: What role do folk stories play in expressing and maintaining culture? 

They depict the culture and religion that were used in that time period and shows the history that 
the culture went through 

 


